
Friday, April 11, 2025 

Announcements 

Seniors 

Attention Juniors:  Do you want to have a Home Lunch 
Pass during your Senior year?  If so, remember that your 
attendance this semester will determine if that is possible.  
In order to be eligible to get your Home Lunch Pass, you 
can not have more than a combined total of 10 unexcused 
tardies and absences.  Also, you must have 160 credits at 
the end of your Junior year to get your Home Lunch Pass. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Attention Students with Parking Permits:  As a reminder, 
you are supposed to be parking where the yellow lines are.  
You are NOT allowed to park in the first four rows of 
parking.  If you do not follow the rules of your parking 
permit, your parking permit will be revoked. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Attention Seniors:  The Biliteracy Seal Application and its 
requirements are now posted in the 12th Grade Google 
Classroom.  Please be sure to submit your application to 
your counselor by May 2nd.  Don’t miss this important 
deadline! 

Attention Seniors:  Have you ordered your cap and gown 
yet?  If not, go to the Senior Info section of SVDons.com 
and click on the link to Jostens to get your order in today.  
Make sure you are ready for graduation and don’t wait 
until the last minute! 

No Games Today! 
 
 

Sports 

Yearbook 

Attention 9th - 12th Graders:  Are you interested in a 
Summer job?  If so, please sign up for the NEXT-GEN 
JOB FAIR.  This job fair is open to all students/residents 
of Baldwin Park ages 14 - 24.  The event is scheduled for 
May 6th at the Courtyard Marriot Hotel in Baldwin Park 
from 9:00am - 1:00pm.  Lunch will be provided and you 
will be bussed to the event with your school. You will need 
to dress in professional business attire and bring a  
resume, preferably.  Please sign up on the Google Form 
found in all Counseling Grade Level Google Classrooms.  
Come see Sandra Anaya in the Counseling Office if you 
are interested in signing up or have any questions.  Please 
sign up by Friday, April 18th. 
 
Attention 9th - 12th Graders:  Do you need volunteer 
hours for college?  Are you interested in volunteering for 
a STEAM Family Night at Bursch Elementary School on 
Tuesday, April 29th, from 4:15pm - 6:00pm?  They need 
your help with assisting the students and families with the 
event and light cleaning up after the event.  Please sign up 
on the Google Form found in all Counseling Grade Level 
Google Classrooms.  Come See Sandra Anaya in the 
Counseling Office if you are interested in signing up or 
have any questions.  Please sign up by Friday, April 18th. 

Seniors:  Yearbook is pleased to announce this year we 
will be producing a PROM SUPPLEMENT for the  
yearbook.  These extra pages will come with the yearbook 
and will be made of YOUR PROM PICTURES.  Check 
out our Instagram and send pictures there or email them 
to Mr. Garcia at rrgarcia629@bpusd.net.  We would love 
to feature your special prom pictures in this supplement.  
Pictures must be submitted by TODAY to be considered.  
This prom supplement is FREE but there is a catch!  Only 
the first 300 yearbooks purchased will receive one.  We 
only have 22 books left before we reach 300.  Any  
yearbooks sold after we reach the 300 mark will not  
receive the prom supplemental pages, so order your  
yearbook right now at yearbookforever.com. 

Clubs & Activities 



Faculty Section 

 

 

 

Scholarships 

Attention Seniors:  Baldwin Park Business Association 

Media Scholarship application deadline is TODAY.  You 

must have a GPA of 2.0+ and submit a video on a given 

prompt.  For more information and to access the online 

application, see Ms. Svider in the Counseling Office. 

 

Attention Seniors:  The Alondra Barragan Scholarship 

application deadline is April 30th.  You must have a GPA 

of 3.0+ and be diagnosed with Lupus.  For more  

information, see Ms. Svider in the Counseling Office 

 

Attention Seniors:  The Waste Management Baldwin Park 

Scholarship program is open to graduating high school 

seniors residing in the City of Baldwin Park that have 

overcome adversity in their quest to graduate and pursue 

their educational goals.  Students must have a current  

semester/grading period GPA of 2.5 or higher.   

Scholarships range in the amounts of $500 to $2500.  For 

more information, see the Senior Google Classroom.  

Deadline to apply is April 30th. 

 

Attention Juniors and Seniors:  The students internship 

program offered by Waste Management is designed to 

provide high school students with an opportunity to learn 

about various career opportunities within Waste  

Management, particularly in the area of community and 

government relations.  The internship program is  

available for one student during the summer.   

You must be: 

  *A resident of Baldwin Park 

  *At least 16 years of age by the start of the internship 

  *Have an unweighted GPA of 3.0 or higher 

  *Participate in a virtual interview with Waste  

    Management 

  *Be able to provide a work permit if selected 

For more information, see the Junior and Senior Google 

Classrooms.  Deadline to apply is April 30th. 

 

 

Group D 

has duty this week 

Friday, April 11, 2025  


